


Proposed Use/ Project Description 
High Sierra Snowcat LLC 

 
High Sierra Snowcat plans to erect an 18’ diameter yurt on a small portion of private land 
located on parcel # 011-220-002-000 for the primary use of renting them out for nightly 
accommodations for up to 6 people. These customers would have the option of being driven in 
over snow in our Thikol Snowcat with heated passenger cabin attached. They would also have 
the option to hire us to provide all food and cooking duties. All cooking and meal preparations 
would be done on sight with fresh ingredients. These customers are primarily backcountry 
skiers and snowboarders, but not limited to this user group, who will be enjoying the winter 
wonderland of the Dunderberg area. Our goal is to provide safe and comfortable 
accommodations, fresh high quality meals, and information about the surrounding area so that 
they may have a truly memorable experience.  
 
In addition to our normal use of the yurt, we will also be providing occasional educational 
courses in the field of avalanche safety and snowpack stability. The only difference between 
these courses and a private trip including food preparation described briefly above, is that the 
customers would be working with an AIARE (American Institute for Avalanche Research and 
Education) certified instructor who will be providing instruction for up to three consecutive 
days.  
 
Additionally, we will have an additional structure placed near the yurt that will be 
approximately 4’ by 5’ that will be used for a toilet system. We will use a 200 gallon storage 
tank that will hold all waste that will then be disposed of at the end of the season. The 
outhouse structure will sit directly over the 200 gallon tank system which has been integrated 
into the outhouse structure. We have talked with Sierra Septic Tank Services, a Bridgeport 
company, that have agreed to collect and transport the waste off of said property. This will 
happen once the snow has melted in the month of May or June. Absolutely no holes will be dug 
into the ground for the purpose of collecting human waste.  












